BID OPENING RESULTS
SALE OF SURPLUS PUBLIC WORKS VEHICLES
APRIL 12, 2018 10:00 A.M.

DISCRIPTION BIDDER BID AMOUNT
2001 GM SIERRA (NOT DRIVABLE) MARK DEBOER $126.26
VIN# GTEK14T3172155584 MIGUEL LEMUS $100.00

MINIMUM BID - $100.00

1999 JEEP CHEROKEE JOHN REE $750.00

VIN# 1J4FF285XL518348 MIGUEL LEMUS $550.00

MINIMUM BID - $500.00

1999 GM 3500HD MIGUEL LEMUS $802.00

VIN# 1GDKC34F2XF024612

MINIMUM BID - $750.00

1999 GM 3500HD JASON MILLS $850.00

VIN# 1GDKC34F2XF02013 JOHN PATTERSON $802.00

MINIMUM BID - $750.00

1998 GM 2500 MARK DEBOER $376.26

VIN# 1GBGC24R1WZ139444

MINIMUM BID - $350.00

1991 IVECO STEP VAN (NOT DRIVABLE) MARK DEBOER $111.26

VIN# ZCFFP3447M1972207

MINIMUM BID - $100.00

ATLAS COPCO AIR COMPRESSOR MIGUEL LEMUS $150.00

XAS 80 DD MARK DEBOER $113.26

MINIMUM BID - $100.00

1997 GM 2500 NO BID

VIN# 1GTGC24R1VZ511276

MINIMUM BID - $350.00

1998 CABLE CAR CONCEPTS NO BID

VIN# 1GBLP37J6W3310898

MINIMUM BID - $7,500.00




DISCRIPTION BIDDER BID AMOUNT
1996 GIANT VAC NO BID
VIN# 96267414
MINIMUM BID - $500.00
1997 GIANT VAC NO BID

VIN# 97270125

MINIMUM BID - $500.00




